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Tankers Charging Drones With Lasers - Focus Of New DARPA Program

Exploring the feasibility of tankers
using lasers to recharge drones’
batteries is the program’s goal, but
it could have bigger implications.

Ukraine’s Bomb Squads Have a New Top Dog

The U.S. Army has agreed to
provide one of its two robotic dogs
to help an American nonprofit
clean up mines and other
ordnance in Ukraine
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TRENDS! 

U.S. plans to sell armed drones to Ukraine in coming days

The Biden administration plans to
sell Ukraine four MQ-1C Gray
Eagle drones that can be armed
with Hellfire missiles for battlefield
use against Russia

https://foreignpolicy.com/2022/06/22/ukraine-bomb-quad-robotic-dog/
https://www.thedrive.com/the-war-zone/tankers-charging-drones-with-lasers-the-focus-of-new-darpa-program
https://www.reuters.com/business/aerospace-defense/exclusive-us-plans-sell-armed-drones-ukraine-coming-days-sources-2022-06-01/


Russia’s War in Ukraine Series No. 4 - Large-Scale War and NATO

Martin Hurt compares Ukraine’s
military capabilities with those of
some Allies and cautions against
making any hasty conclusions
about NATO’s ability to rapidly
reinforce and defend its smaller
member states in a potential war.

Russia’s War in Ukraine Series No. 3 - Russian Military Logistics

In this brief Dr Ronald Ti examines
Russia’s failures in planning and
executing logistics operations for its
war in Ukraine. In large part, these
failures can be attributed to
systemic weaknesses.
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MUST READ! - UKRAINE-Special  

https://icds.ee/wp-content/uploads/dlm_uploads/2022/06/ICDS_Brief_Russias_War_in_Ukraine_No3_Ronald_Ti_June_2022.pdf
https://icds.ee/wp-content/uploads/dlm_uploads/2022/06/ICDS_Brief_Russia%C2%B4s_War_in_Ukraine_No4_Martin_Hurt_June_2022.pdf

